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Lewes District Council Working in partnership with Eastbourne Homes

Date Provided: 31 August 2021
Title Garages

Ref: FOI 14277

Information Request

1. The total number of lock-up domestic garages owned by the councils.

2. The total number of these garages that are currently empty.

3. The total number that are currently let to council estate residents.

4. The total number that are let to non-council estate residents.

5. The estimated average total space in sq ft of all the council-owned garages.

Response by Lewes District Council

Lewes

1. The total number of lock-up domestic 707
garages owned by the councils.

2. The total number of these garages that 374
are currently empty.

3. The total number that are currently let to | The council does not hold

council estate residents. this information
4. The total number that are let to non- 0 — the council does
council estate residents. not let garages out for

commercial use

5. The estimated average total space in sq. | The council does not hold
ft of all the council-owned garages. this information




