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Date Provided: 16 August 2021

Title: Bulky Waste

Ref: FOI 14218

Information Request

Q1. How many bulky waste items were collected in your authority in during the
following timescales?

Q1a. How many of the items collected were sent to landfill during the following
timescales?

Q1b. How many of the items collected were recycled during the following
timescales?

Q1c. How many of the items collected were eligible for reuse during the
following timescales?

Q2. If recorded, what was the breakdown of numbers of items collected?
Please specify for both May 2020 - April 2021 and May 2019 - April 2020:

Q3. What is your local authority's approach to recycling versus reusing bulky
waste items?

Response by Lewes District Council

| have reviewed your request and investigated whether there is any
information which can be disclosed to you. Please find below the information
the council holds, and which | am pleased to provide to you.

Q1. How many bulky waste items were collected in your authority in during the
following timescales?
e The council does not hold a breakdown of the number of items
and their types. We only have tonnages.

Q1a. How many of the items collected were sent to landfill during the following
timescales?

Q1b. How many of the items collected were recycled during the following
timescales?

Q1c. How many of the items collected were eligible for reuse during the
following timescales?



e The council does not hold this information. We collect and
transfer items to East Sussex County Council who are the waste
disposal authority.

Q2. If recorded, what was the breakdown of numbers of items collected?
Please specify for both May 2020 - April 2021 and May 2019 - April 2020:
¢ The council does not hold a breakdown of the number of items
and their types

Q3. What is your local authority's approach to recycling versus reusing bulky
waste items?
¢ The council follows the waste hierarchy of Reduce, Reduce,
Recycle



